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IT STARTED simple: A long-
time drug informant accused

a narcotics officer of fabricating
evidence to frame suspected
drug dealers.

But in the 11 months since the
Daily News first detailed the alle-
gations lodged by informant Ven-
tura Martinez
against Officer
Jeffrey Cujdik,
the fallout is far
from simple,
with no conclu-
sion in sight.

An FBI-led in-
v e s t i g a t i o n ,
launched in Feb-
ruary at the
start of the
n ew s p a p e r ’ s
“Tainted Jus-
tice” series, is
moving forward
and continually
expanding, ac-
cording to Chief Inspector Antho-
ny DiLacqua, who heads the po-
lice department’s Internal Af-
fairs Bureau, which is working
with the FBI.

“It’s quite involved,” DiLacqua
said. “It’s not as simple to close
out as other jobs. We’re trying to
leave no stone un-
turned. . . . Sometimes we’re
led somewhere unexpected and
we follow another path. There’s
multiple people with multiple alle-
gations.”

In fact, this is the single largest
case that Internal Affairs investi-
gators are handling, he said.

The investigation mush-
roomed in March when the Daily
News reported allegations that
Cujdik and other members of the
Narcotics Field Unit disabled sur-
veillance cameras during raids of
bodegas and smoke shops that
sold tiny ziplock bags, which po-
lice consider drug paraphernalia.
After the officers sliced or cut the
wires, thousands of dollars in
cash and merchandise were miss-
ing, the merchants said.

Many of the merchants were
hardworking immigrants who
spoke little to no English and
were not familiar with the crimi-
nal justice system. FBI agents
have since interviewed many
store owners, using translators
when necessary.

The investigation took another
twist when three women alleged
that Officer Thomas Tolstoy fon-
dled, groped or sexually violated

them during
drug raids.

Cujdik, Tol-
stoy and three
other officers
remain on
desk duty.

Even though
no officer has
been charged
with a crime,
many of their
drug cases
have been
dropped and
some drug sus-
pects have
gone free.

“[The ‘Taint-
ed Justice’ series] has forced the
Philadelphia District Attorney’s
Office to recognize that it cannot
bring any cases involving these of-
ficers as long as this investigative
cloud hangs over their actions,”
said Assistant Public Defender
Bradley S. Bridge.

The series has not only impact-
ed pending cases, but more than
50 convicted drug dealers are
fighting for new trials, alleging
that narcotics officers fabricated
evidence against them, Bridge
said.

Meanwhile, at least 15 civil
suits have been filed in federal
court, naming 15 officers and the
Police Department as defen-
dants.

One of those lawsuits was
brought by Lady Gonzalez, who
alleges that Tolstoy fondled her
breasts during a drug raid at her
Kensington home in December
2007.

Her attorney, Jeremy Ibrahim,
is puzzled why the investigation
is taking so long, particularly alle-

gations involving Tolstoy.
“I can only surmise that special

rules apply when the accused is
in the police department,” Ibra-
him said. “I only hope federal au-
thorities will do what the city au-
thorities are apparently incapa-
ble of doing — and that’s justice.”

Prominent civil-rights attor-
ney David Rudovsky is handling
five of the 15 lawsuits; four of the
five are bodega owners. Ru-
dovsky said that he plans to zero
in on what he views as a lapse in
supervision of narcotics officers
and their informants, who are
paid by the police department for
making drug buys.

Police brass have since made
major changes in the Narcotics
Division. Police Commissioner
Charles Ramsey split up the offic-
ers in Cujdik’s squad and appoint-
ed a chief integrity officer to scru-
tinize drug investigations.

The department also imple-
mented a new 22-page directive
on Sept. 11 that places tighter con-
trols on officers and their infor-
mants.

“There’s a lot more oversight
responsibility placed on the ser-
geants and lieutenants,” Deputy
Commissioner William Black-
burn said.

One major change, said Black-
burn, is that a supervisor must
witness all payments to infor-
mants. “I do think things are
working better with the over-
sight,” he said.

As the FBI-led investigation
continues, many involved in the
criminal justice system anxious-
ly await an outcome.

Guy R. Sciolla, a defense attor-
ney who represents a few sus-
pects arrested by Cujdik, said
that it’s best for everyone in-
volved, including the officers, for
the investigation to wrap up
soon.

“You’ve got police on tenter-
hooks,” Sciolla said. “You’ve got
defendants on tenterhooks. And
you’ve got the District Attorney
and defense attorneys in the mid-
dle. Problem is, what to do with
the open cases? . . . We’re all sit-
ting here on standby.” i

TAINTED JUSTICE: A SERIES IN REVIEW

You can join more than 65,000 other

Philadelphia-area residents on Martin

Luther King Day, Jan. 18, by volunteering

in one of hundreds of projects in the

15th annual Greater Philadelphia

Martin Luther King Day of Service.

Name E-mail

Number of volunteers (1 if Individual)

Group name (if applicable)

Address

City State

ZIP County

Phone: (day) (night)

In which county would you like to volunteer?

Bucks Chester Delaware Montgomery

Philadelphia Camden Burlington Other county

Mail or fax this form to:

KING DAY OF SERVICE

c/o Global Citizen

7 Benjamin Franklin Parkway

Philadelphia, PA 19103

Fax: 215-665-2647

Info: 215-665-2475

Register at www.mlkdayofservice.org

Please call 215-

665-2475 if you

are interested in

creating a project.

I Want to Serve
MARTIN LUTHER KING

DAY OF SERVICE
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A COP AND AN INFORMANT
GOT TOO CLOSE AND
BENT THE RULES.

NOW, THE INFORMANT
FEARS FOR HIS LIFE.
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